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NEW/UNBUNDLED SERVICES PLAN RIDER 
 

 

(Continued on reverse side) 

I. APPLICATION 
 

This New/Unbundled Services Plan (“Plan”) Rider NUS (“Rider”) defines the procedures to 
add, unbundle and eliminate service and product offerings, and to provide new pricing 
options. 

 
II. DEFINITIONS 
 

A. Basic Services 
 

“Basic Services” are those Company services related to the continuing provision of 
electric service provided by facilities of less than 69 kV voltage, and related operations, 
and the provision of billing, information and ancillary services, unless such services are 
identified as Non-Basic Services, as defined below.  Basic Services are provided 
pursuant to the Company’s rate schedules, except for those identified as Non-Basic 
Service Rate Schedule(s) (defined below), and associated riders. 

 
B. Non-Basic Services 

 
“Non-Basic Services” are those services or activities that cause the Company to incur 
or avoid costs directly attributable to a customer’s request or action and/or that provide 
a discretionary offering to the customer, which services and activities are generally 
described and provided pursuant to rate schedules and policies specified in 
Attachment A to this Rider (“Non-Basic Service Rate Schedules”). 

 
III. NEW SERVICES/UNBUNDLINGS/ELIMINATIONS 
 

A. General 
 

The Company may add, unbundle or eliminate services or products and provide new 
pricing options in accordance with the provisions of this Rider, so long as the 
Parameters specified in § IV are satisfied. The review process for any filings of 
proposed additions, reclassifications, eliminations or new options is as specified in § 
V.  Described below are the specific types of filings that can be made under this Plan. 

 
B. New Services 

 
The Company may provide a new service, product or pricing option (a “New Service”).  
Such event shall be reflected, as appropriate, by creation of, or revision of, Company 
rate schedule(s). 
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C. Unbundlings 
 

The Company may unbundle, as a Non-Basic Service, a service or activity previously 
provided as part of Basic Services (an “Unbundled Service”).  Such event shall be 
reflected, as appropriate, by creation of, or revision of, Non-Basic Services Rate 
Schedule(s). 

 
D. Eliminations 

 
The Company may cease to offer a service or activity previously provided as a Non-
Basic Service (an “Eliminated Service”).  Such event shall be reflected, as appropriate, 
by timely elimination of, or revision of, Non-Basic Services Rate Schedule(s). 

 
IV. PARAMETERS FOR NEW SERVICES/UNBUNDLINGS/ELIMINATIONS 
 

A. The price of a New Service or an Unbundled Service must exceed the incremental 
costs to provide such New Service or Unbundled Service. 

 
B. A New Service or Unbundled Service offering shall be voluntary to customers. 

 
C. A New Service or Unbundled Service offering shall be made available to all similarly 

situated customers.  
 

D. If the price of a New Service or an Unbundled Service is below fully-allocated 
embedded costs, the difference between the price and the fully allocated embedded 
costs will be borne by the Company and not borne by the Company's other customers. 

 
E. An Eliminated Service must be shown to have a lack of an appropriate level of market 

demand or must be shown to be competitive.  
 
V. REVIEW AND APPROVAL PROCESS 
 

A. Filings of proposed New Service(s), Unbundled Service(s) or Eliminated Service(s) (a 
“Plan Filing”) shall be made ninety (90) days in advance of the proposed effective date.  
Company shall provide to the Staff of the Commission (“Staff”) supporting 
documentation and workpapers to prove that the Parameters are satisfied. 

 
B. A Plan Filing will be considered approved ninety (90) days after the filing date unless, 

within such ninety (90) days, a party requests and the Commission approves that the 
Plan Filing be docketed.  If so docketed, the traditional suspension period for tariff 
review will apply. 

 



Page 27.3 

 

ATTACHMENT A TO RIDER NUS 
 

NON-BASIC SERVICES RATE SCHEDULES 
 
 

 
SOURCE (RATE SCHEDULES/POLICES) DESCRIPTION 
  
Miscellaneous Electric Services Tariff,  

Rate Schedule MES 
 
Various miscellaneous services and activities 

  
Basic Service Rate Schedules Late payment charges 

 
Overhead Extension Policy Overhead extensions 

 
Underground Extension Policy Underground extensions 

 
Additional Facilities Charge Rider, Rider AFC 
 

Additional facilities 
 

Company’s other Street and Outdoor Lighting 
tariffs 

 
Installed and leased lighting 
 

 




